
August 6-8 
 

EXTRA REGISTRATION FORMS 
AVAILABLE IN THE CHURCH OFFICE 

AND ONLINE. 

REGISTRATION DEADLINE: 
JULY 26, 2021 

Early Bird JULY 4, 2021 

Pack your bags and 
join us for a fun 
filled weekend! 

245 Portage Trail 
Cuyahoga Falls, OH 

330-923-5241 
www.firstchurchcf.com 

 
Come Explore…    
       ...Experience God    
  

First United Methodist 

Church 

BRING A FRIEND TO CAMP 

THIS YEAR!!!!! 

    For Incoming 

  4th, 5th and 6th 

        Graders 
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2021 Wesley 

Summer Camp 



TRANSPORTATION:  

Families will be dropping and picking 
their kids up at Camp Inspirations Hills 
this year to help with social distancing.  
Drop off will be at noon on Friday, 
Aug. 6.  Pick up will be at 3:30pm 
Sunday afternoon with a family cook-
out when you arrive for pick up. 

      

CAMP FEES: 

The total cost for camp is $125.00, for 
the Early Bird discount by  paying a 
$25.00 deposit, before July 4th, your 
balance will then be $100.00 by July 
25th.  The cost after July 4th is $150. 

 

For your convenience, the church now 
accepts credit cards and pay pal. 

Scholarships are available, for families 
regularly involved, upon request, need 
and approval.  Applications are availa-
ble in the Education Office.  Deadline 
for applications is July 4th.  

 

Please remember one registration 
form per youth. 

 

All health forms and  

fees must be received 

in the church office by 

July 25, 2021 

REGISTRATION: 

Please send in the attached registration 
form and a signed permission slip is  
required. The permission slip, a health 
form and more detailed information will 
be mailed to all those who are           
registered.  

Remember you must have a new one 
filled out & on file before leaving for 
camp. 

     

 

WHAT TO EXPECT: 

A lot of fun with your friends, archery, 
singing, hiking, swimming in the lake, 
campfires, games, ga-ga ball, cook outs 
and much, much more.  All in a socially 
distanced safe environment. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

WHERE IS INSPIRATION HILLS CAMP? 

Inspiration Hills Camp is a Church of the 
Brethren Camp in Burbank, OH.  

Their address is 4819 West Easton 
Road Burbank, Ohio  

Visit their website at http://
www.inspirationhillscamp.org/ 
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